
?atilt q f icc  
	 (T) 

(\scu vrat aT1rr4TTr) 

xishcii•l, 05 9T4, 2010 

4)-TF19 14, 1931 Ylcb 

si 	xi .9,4 cr) 

fazwit 3T-tug—I 

TELQ71 3g7/79-R-1-b0-1(i)-b02010 
Cg-TG, 05 WTI. 2010 

3TRRWiT 

f[41 

"ITRU TT iitc-iTg" 	arfa-d-  zoo 	aTzfrg tivt191ci M -471 4 ‘1(t1 	 DEIT9 Husci 

19-41zI at aif1iflTI-TT 4l71-r1 1f4 (1#11tri) ft4g- , 2010 tr1" gikb 03 Trl, 2010.  

‘3971% 779 t 	qT,  dm( cii:vr afe4trli eitsqr 9 19 zolo 	Thct TrthlizliturzirTE49r4 TEr 

et971 ART smf:Om 1r 	:- 

	

\3cri(ti (1.4 gm 91.15(1 ti 	31T aTNTrtt WiT 4-1711 	- IT ft1-4 (#qfram) - 

ST, 2010'.  
	 MT 	ticsttf 9 19 2010) 

[411T 3ccit SibT F4ETN gcr gm getu 

dm{ 	0,nfl ftET9' TFUF (liTt4 q3traitr4f at 17) aTfaig, 1980 at ,3CCIk 

AkK thr4 fon muso (atimifkli 	adrf atEliA) Ganzfrf, 1952 TITI crit sIbT Tit ( 	d-i, 

Cffli 

 

at Atuf ‘iLicirreT) .3TIV4423, 1981 T5J 3TOT Ttql)q7 cbt4 

TITM 	Li 	W164 44 .4 fl-1f6Fi9cr •AfAtril cmiur Tar :- 

34Einzt-q- 	• 

mr(Ntb 

1- ZT aTftfikTTIT 	cr-aw 	 rarg gW1 ti4t4 at 3TrgTh-ift ffErf 	9111F1 11,1 

IMT TtlEN 34re4zig 2010 45T viiktilf I 

71t1 	I 	.1 917.9R-RTioRwr 	/crao 

 

.9 cep 7i0410-91 /2008--b 0 

 

    

M-421-tot 

 

     

Iffutd,  59f TM-WI 

TM laPircr (item( ATU metaDM 



3cc1. srZto 3111tit14 

(-8.9-41 23 (13.  1980 
eti 8117.1 3 IA 4.46rg 

EmuI ET SET8 

8171 15-8i 

f4a1819 

EFT 24 WI T42*8118 

3cN cre.:81 SiTiTtiNul1 	05 01d, 2010 

z". 

87-4.1 26-E8 EN 

q3N1-8 

311V4I4-t 

dal+, CikZ1 thr+-1 ittIff 	Scf (ff4-€11371•Mreff ett NF) alftAZITI, 1980 %-1.  
#q111Tff 

2-..3c0( 	iOrel ft2111 1-1u.8r1 (tiqt.q) EJf  \34rr6;2141.  31It 	. 
.3•711TIFI, 1980 t, FMt *8.  ‘31-armr 	3T1-4r alf4rp:Fr =ire) 	q1(1 3 4, 
\wail(' (1) 4 	 RTH tg 	 2Ait .F-44" 7.-Gr R-4 
qr-441 

3-7 37f41 -44 t .qm 4 4 TC "4r5,6 r) mit 	P-.117 tr); 
"qTpr F:),[14. q4" 	 Pq4 -r-Elt I 

	

4-1j5r1 alfeltR zft 21W 15-T, .14 	"g e,r9( 	t T-2119- 	Ue; 
. t,(44" (tq I4 u44 i 

5-171 .3-fiikrjr7 t" ZIRT 	4 	 t)94" 
7-21-19.  R  Rlz-P; 	'>Q11( 11:111" (t4 fair 	. 

6-7 .34f4F-974 11 ZITU 24 4 atrgi<1 (1) 4- 

() 	"s: ulJJ 	 ITT 	,AK -544" Tr.±4 
R-9-54 -r44 

(U) Wqrf ITC14 374 	 P.-IN ITT 5.11 
"end.  4r --cr-2('' 

alfrerf t).  Z.TRT 	 T-Thd tiTlt-ircrAct ETRT t( 

"26--t (1) •441. 	 3-1-e4 t ‘1*1-1 ft-fIT ‘311171k WCF(1.  Thrl 
41I141Pcb 	t ,ticrt .71 tWN 311 	41- 1 34-11:F4 4s1-9-  acit 
a-, a-frt so% t q&N, 	 4s9 	-Frr 
Tic•bd.1( 	t ,rwitri• 

(2) 	R 	 Tt qi6 24 t 372110 (1) t 33- Terff 4zn- 
t Q4) .1{ t.t 	a AIM, t 	t WT4 dti,) ikffkHclkilf 4q1-ff 

t 50% t cithlt '4iikqiikc 	 4p tr tfrr LiRvErt Gmftrit54,41( 
\J114 'II: 

'TT% 	LIR 4%/441 EIRT 3 	 ach-r ap.mr %TM 24 t 
317qM (1) t  	4W9. fii chglt 	q?; 31:11.7T (1) m3TRTRT (2) 

31-tid 	 117'ocbc,It 9tf 	 

UM 4 4:1 #P1TE/9 

3MT 3:ft 

8i1CPLIT 11 97.  1952 
. 111 8111 2 	Ti•PlE.114 

31E4414-6-1•1 	 . 

Wat4T thrq RETT9.  6c1 	 7:0.) a4e4Zfri,. 1952 

TitEF 

8-‘371( sr-?-,vr <1 	 ( 	t 	clf uierr 	g•TWA-Trfr, 
1952 tr. It7.7-1•9 a•Taliq 4 mr4 	 S1re4zrizr cbc1 Nr L zrm 2. 4, ,344Fr (1) 

ca-e4 	q-4t" t T2-TT9.  'TT Ii54 "q1thr Ou1lt 714" tW lt.4 .1 /411 	I 

9-17 .3114ftql7 Thrt 2TRT 	31TtITT,1 (3) 4 	"qt-f ?nr-TT t)44" 

,hu4"  	_Witit I 



'TM ;Its! 314IRIN(31 1R.I1Z. 05 Tir-4, 2010 3 

3Ttz11.4-WC 

TT Ali 	( 	d-f, 'TM 0117 5104 ‘314,514:1) aillAtm, 1981 Z5f14411EF 

10-3MT SIkT 	Oc 	̀11.MT alif ST01  ‘344-tr) aiN1 -47, 1981 0 

VT 3 4- 	 • 

	

(t) zglifIT (1) 4 	"ti1-4 Q.11( O‘A"i P49 7 lsd. "c4it6 

aft Otl" 	fe-.4 er4i 
- 

(N) ucitIT7T (2) 11 YrC 	-evil( 5144 	(-41-1 t"TB 

Z717 	rd-.4 .714'1 I 

.3N1 STb1 

381n111 	i 14 

739 1981 t 

3 EIIit1117 

    

	

\3S, F1 	m-rtur 

(1-.4 F4419 sfird i71-41:41 74 GachIncii 74T 4-1.,Wlur 1t 3917:1 td9., 	R tZ0-TRT 

p-lif4.21T34 j stcf (194 A •-i[feTtrf 	Rog' ITT l qyqj  R gofi(I tr4 ‘rlic1-1 4144 	11711 

SicTria tlic) F 7:7 N=Pt4e-r ftETT Trt P, 	,i71( 	(lot( 1-̀4Errq 

Trait a-t-c 49.n) ate9-zpi, 1980 Sclt Cfbi tivtI jq9 slu.Scf 	 :Her iif sit) 

'aTfeAtrIT, 1952 UZIT %.4t 51t4T R (c1-1, TIT tt C1071' ‘34sP-q) atse-itrEr, 1981 WT #049 chtc:\b 

1:1w1 F4419 rfcg7 	t 74 3Tfbtift4 atu 	 ci-ft,i'wp cr4 	V-tirerctf34 

S9tIrtra -tfl '414 r4T1t1 4 *4  	 Fr& TYzr 

• 	

{-Q1 

Yir aiTT-4 '4)ir TrErr t 	(1.4 ftzTr9 trugR t 7 wall-  Rrt 77,4 wci-41 	triticr41 

'0 0'67 Ertl-el:11   FA-44. cbt-11 Ll*di zt,  I ‘31cii 6.10 7 tr-c 	 ifitrird-WA F 

4-6 41 Rik.qW1 it-4T TFIT t 	WI 1.98o t 	a-Treizrri 4 thrq 	 t 	A-4.fz• 

atir 	 j crail4rit t rag tuflaiRch qp zii .51T4t1T9.  P.m -7raT I 

5,141.4t 3147?r ostr Ibtri Tiv-g7 t-14(4 atIT .eTrutrft Ma   	,1-13fttrf 1!it (Ti.Pti.M) 

f4445, 2010 T.-.R111 	,4101 zt I 

38-811 

<12,Y1C116I, 

I . 

No. 397(2)ILXXIX-V-1 I 0-1( ka)-10-2010 

_Mucci LUCA710W. Man.b 05. 2010 

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Ankle 348 Of the Constitution, the povernor.  is 

, pleased to order the publicaiion of the fcillowing English translation of the Uttar Pradesh.Rajya Vidhan 1  

,Maridal Sadasya Aur Adhikari tatha -Maittri Sukli-Spvidha Vidlti (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010 (Uttar 

Pradesh Adhinivatii Sankhya 9'of 2010) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the 



3-cfg 	31TIETRui 4 1M-C, 05 RT-4, 2010 

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE MEMBERS AND OFFICERS AND 

MINISTERS AMENITIES LAWS (AMENDMENT) ACT. 2010 

(UP. ACT NO. 9 OF 2010) 

[As passed bv the Uttar Pradesh Legislature] 

AN 

ACT 

jiwther to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members E1170h011eniS and 

Pension) Act, 1980 and the Uttar Pthdesh Suite Legislature (Officers Salaries and 

Allowances) /la, 1952 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and 

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981. 

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Sixty-first Year.  of Republic of India as follows :- • 

CHAPTER-I 

Preliminary 

I. This Act may be,  called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature Members and 

Officers and Ministers Amenities Laws (Amendment) Act. 2010. 

CHAFFER-B 

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments and 

Pension) Act, 1980 

In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments 

and Pension) Act, 1980. hereinafier referred to in. his chapter as the principal Act. in 

sub-section (1) Ibr the words "three thousand rupees" the words "eight, thousand 

rupees" shall be substituted. 

In section 4 of the principal Act lin-  the words "fifteen thousand rupees" the 

words "twenty two thousand rupees" shall be substituted: 

In 'section 15-A of the principal, Act .fin-  the words "six thousand rupees" 

the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

In section 18-A of the principal Act in clause (a) foil the words "six 

thousand rupees" the words "ten thousandirup.eershall,bestibmingeiL 

In section 24 of the principalAct.in  subrsectitin 

Shoo title 

Amendment of 
section 3 of U.P. 
Act no. 23 of 1980 

Amenthnent of 
section 4 

Amendment of 
section 15-A 

Amendment of 
section 18-A 

Amendment of 
section 24 

Amendment Of 
section 26-A 

(a).  for the words "six thousand rupees" the word "seven thousand 

-rupees" shall be substituted; 

(b) for the words "five hundred rupees"' nppearinw in the firs- proviso. 3  

the words "seven thousand rupees" shalt be substituted. 

7. For section 26-A of the principal Act the following section shall be 

substituted:.--- 

.11 "26-A (I) If a sitting member, dies during the tenure of his or het) 

Family 	office. the spouse of such member shall be entitled t 

Pension to a family pension equal .to 50% pension inherwisel 

Admissible to the deceased member at the time of death, for the life-time ota 

such spouse. 

(2) If an ex-member, who is entitled to a pension under, 
sub-section Cl) of section 24, dies. the spouse of such ex-member shall be 

entitled to • a family pension equal to 50% of pension of such 
ex-member at the time of death. for the life-time of such spouse: -,; 

Provided that if the spouse is entitled to a salary under section 3 or a 'pension: 

under subrsection (1) of section 24 she/he will .not be entitled to receive familyy 

pension under sub-section (,1) or sub-section (2). 	• 	 • 

I 176 Rgii_vidiiim 131: 	il-Aclni-20 I 0 Data 2 



drk Sf .Y1 31411I-1Rul 	05 'MIL 2010 
	

5 

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers' Salaries and 

Allowances) Act, 1952 

8. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and 

Allowances) Act, 1952, hereinotier referred to in this chapter as the principal Act, in 

sub-section (1) for the words "five thousand rupees" the words "twelve thousand 

rupees" shall be substituted. 

. 	9. ln section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3) for the words "ten 

2nd thousand rupees" the words "fifteen thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

CHAPTER-1V 

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries. Allowances and 

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981 

Amendment tiI 

section 2 or Up. 
Act no. I I of 

1952 

Amendment of 

section 4 

10. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries. Allowances and 
Amendment or 

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981,- 
section 3 of U.P. 

Act no. 14 or 

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words "five thousand rupees" the words 1981 

"twelve thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

-(b) in sub-section (2) for the words "four thousand rupees" the words 

"ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

STATEMENT OF 01311ECTS AND REASONS 

The pay, allowances, pension and other amenities admissible to the members and officers of the 

State Legislature and to the ministers have not been revised for a quite some time. In view of the price rise 

and escalation in cost of living it has been decided to revise the same so that they may serve the cause of 

their constituency in a meaningful manner by amending the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' 

Emoluments and Pension) Act:  1980. the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and 

Allowances) Act, 1952 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries. Allowances and Miscellaneous 

_Provisions) Act, 1981. 

It has been experienced that the spouses of deceased members and ex-members of legislature have 

been facing hardship and have been living in penury. In difference to the dignity of office which they have. 

held it has also been decided to provide for making, in the aforesaid Apt of 1980, provision for family,. 

pension to the spouse of the deceased members and ay-members of the State Legislature. 

The Uttar Pradesh.  State Legislature Members and Officers and Ministers Amenities LaWSI.  

(Amendment) Bill. 2010 is.introduced accordingly: 

By order. 

P.V. KUSFINVAIIA. . 

Sachir. 

touroz00-70 1:110-1176 th44,1-(t0)-2010-(2497)-597-(tvV41/31Trbt)1 

tOcref0 Ot0-70 410-237 TITO F44141-2010- 2498 -850 c40-a/a1115tIZ I 

td 


