——-

AR ARER—YHoTHollo / Tlo—

T@o / THolle—91 / 2008--10
AFIN T e VT FRIAR €

Z%E?

T MR A 2T TR
SR

fErdt TRRre
A1, ES (F)
(@R wew sfaam)

qET%, YHAR, 05 HIH, 2010
B[ 14, 1931 D T

TE Ve IR
faurd argarT—1

Heam 397 / 79-f2-1—10-1(F)-10-2010
AEHE, 05 WE, 2010

fafau
_ ”Wwéﬁﬁm“%a@zzoo%aﬁmm%mﬁﬂmﬁmw
wem o ot am A gu-gRe R (deve) R, 2010 WX fA% 03 AW, 2010 &
arjq%maﬁaﬁrazwq%mWM9ﬁzmo%mﬁmwzﬁle
Fftrge & R R @ 2 - o
IR SR T R Toew B 9 el qur AR gE-gRe Ry (Fehe)

{ IR - ariafEm, 20100 . T .
' : (IwTe SRy A W@ 9 w7 2010)
1 | ST I Ry REE Toed 210 aitd 3N )

f Serc R (v R Aves (Geed @ Iuererdl ot Ygm) s, 1980 ST SRR
Ry ey ReE e (GReRd $ a0 qw Tw) ofbEm, 1952 W SRR e (EE,
o st gueee) P, 1981 H ST WA B B R -
A T 3 zweed ad # Frefien sfufem awm o -
. : HOE-TF - :
1—%,&@%@3&1@1@%%%@@1@4%@@ wiera A%
T E-gi AR (Feie) sRiEE, 2010 @ AT :




"

2 YR g2 JEHRY T, 05 M, 2010
-y
mﬁsrmﬁaﬁw(maﬁmﬁﬁaﬂ?ﬁ‘m) e, 1980 &
e
AT e sty -5 R T R9T v (wewdl @ suareEdr it doH)

@2l 23 a7 1980
T UM 3 A deieT

ey, 1980ﬁ,ﬁﬁ§aawmﬁmﬁaﬁaﬁﬁ‘rmmw%w3ﬁ.
ww(l)ﬁsm“ﬁqwm”%wmwma”eﬂaz?rm'ma”r@ﬁ%

| S |
€1 4 F Hgih 3—WWWﬁ_W4ﬁW“WWF®”%WQTSE
AR FR B0 @ R e .
url 15-3; @ A SRR & A 15-% § w e me w0 & w9 g
ik T ET e T Ry
o 183 3 5-gu ARAFET # gy 18-% § ez (%) ¥ 5= “& v T F
el W WA T R SR @ B ow
817 24 %1 Haed 6-Ha Hiefam 9 a1y 24 § Iuum (1) -
(%) =2 “m FA7 TR” F =W @ wm W wA s T
ECRE e

(@) v w9 = g ' F R w oo
*{I’;ZG-%W 70 AR @ oA 26-% @ wm W Prefater o o &
e o _

“26-% (1) AR W H el B A Bl aree wee
W’ﬁﬁmﬂéma‘ﬁ%wmvﬁ&m‘m&msﬁ
a,aﬂ%'so%%wwﬁmﬁmﬁwwwmmﬁw
FHETL & A - '

(2] 3% yIgd w=E A A 24 F oA (1) B avly de

B EHER A A UG A T, A Gg F v T et ad de

%50%%Wmﬁmﬁsmwmﬁ/ﬁmmmé

—_— .

g [ AR el a3 @ e A9 otwar amr 24 @
Ecram(n%ewiﬁﬁaﬁ&mwms‘f,a‘raaaqm‘r(;)maqw{z)
F R WA Yo @ eET @ S

' HeAG-TH .

S T RN e (SR S ¥ qwn w) offem, 1952 &
' it | "7

T e 8-3T WU U FGum qvew (sriEr F B AT auT W) T,
=T 11 A9 1952 NP S - ‘ N , ,
# am 2 @ ey 1952 7T I F@T F oW @ affEw s w2, amr 2 8 a‘q'a]'rr[ (1)
gy o 2AR Y B WM W OE 9N & TR T RY R
W4T oA 9-q% S @ a0 4 #, Suawr (3) ¥ s 2@ aog mqdt &
e, IS T ST SUmTE ETY :@”Nr‘ggv_ﬁi}ﬁ_ﬁ@ﬁ#_ ‘




‘——-‘_‘——_;.

A TSI L] T, 05 A, 2010 3

e s A (B, e ol bt Swea) o, 1981 F Hete
mwmw(aaa Wl AT S 39ed) offaiem, 1981 I R
wfufrm F=m 14

gra 3 % ' . ' -T-FilQBIEﬁIEH"I
(a;).m()ﬁma_“qmwmﬁ”%mww“m’é 3 @ e

vmmﬁ"r@fé“ﬁaﬁﬁn
()mm()ﬁﬂa“mwmﬁ“%mww“m
R TR @ RA S

8 faae wvEd & mwwmﬁmwwﬁmaﬁﬁ?ﬁqm@m
gﬁmeﬁmﬁwngwe{wﬁmwnIMHWUﬂwm%q@ﬁ
qﬁ;ﬁg@mr@awu’ﬁﬁmmwa%wﬁwmmmm(ﬁmw :
owafEi $i o) s, 1980 I R (T RUR Toew (GRETE B ¥ aw a®)
- afafrE, 1952 q ST w3w o (3, W i sl sued) sffem, 1981 & HdAET B
'umﬁammaﬁaﬁqaaﬁmrﬂtﬁamwmamﬁ,umqa-m_zg@-gmmaﬁa%

G e e e § onr Frafer 8 1 far A w0 R a9
&wmﬁ;mws%mﬁmm%qawmwm%ﬁm
'ﬁmﬁﬁﬁ%ﬁfﬁwﬁaﬁ*mmaﬁmwwmnﬁmﬁ%mﬁg&
g A R R w2 ﬁawwao%maﬁﬁmﬁm%mm%wm-
ﬁrwmﬁ%qﬁm%%ﬁmﬁmﬁmﬁmmmmﬁwml .

Wwﬁﬂmﬁwmmaﬁveﬂmmﬁwgﬁmﬁﬁ Hsﬁem)
R, 201037%&1%%41%@

-

amsn 9,
. . =fy
Sl‘
No. 397(2¥LXXIX-V-1- 10-1(ka)-10-2010
. Dated Luckrmw. March 05,2010 oo

N pur\mmcc of the provisions of clause (3) of Anicic 348 of the Constitution. Lhc Governor'is
p!edecd to order the publicaiion of the following English tr: ‘mslation of the Utiar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan °
Mandal Sadasva Aur Adhikari tatha Mantri Sukh-Suvidha Vidhi {Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010 (Utar
Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 9 of 2010) as pav.scd by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the

»




4 TER GLT IJWERY 71u7e, 05 9rd, 2010

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE MEMBERS AND OFFICERS AND
MINISTERS AMENITIES LAWS (AMENDMENT) ACT. 2010
(U.P. ACTNGC. 9 0F 2010)
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh 1, egistaiure]

AN

ACT
Surther to amend the Uttar Pradesh Stare Legislature (Members' Emolumenis cmd
Pension) Act, 1980 und the Uttar Pradesh Sraie Legistuture (Officers Saluries cmd :

Allowances) Act, 1952 and h’?e Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Saluries, Allowances ang
M:\ceh':uwom Provisions) Act, 1981.

IT1S HEREBY enacted in the Sixty-first Year of Republic of India as follows :--

CHAPTER-I]
 Preliminary
Shar title ' 1. This Act may be called the Utlar Pradesh State Legislature Members ‘and
Officers and Ministers Amenities Laws (Amendment) Act. 2010,
CHAPTER-IL _
Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Mcmbers’ Emoluments and
Pensmn) Act, 1980

Am?ﬁdmcﬂ} of - In section, 3 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’ Emoluments g
f‘f‘“::?’;i#izgn and Penslon) Act, 1980. her einafter referred to in his chapter as the principal Act. in '
sub-section (1} for the words “three thousand rupees” the words “eight thousand %
rupees” shall be subsritured.

Amendment of 3. In section 4 of the principal Act for the words “fifieen thousand rupees” the %
section 4 words “twenty two thousand rupees” shall be substinuted. . !
Amendment of 4. In-séction 15-A of the principal, Act for the words “su ihous«md rupees” b :
section 13-A the words " ‘ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted. ' ' :
Amendment of - 5. In section 18-A of the prmc:lpa.] Act m clause (a) for the words “six "
section |8-A thousand rupees™ the words “ten thousand rupees’ shall be substitured:. “.‘
Amendment of 6. In section 24 of the principal Act.. in sub.—sectﬂi?@u (.- .

i

section 24 L]
' _~fa} for the words “six thousand rupees” the words: “seven: thousand '
rupees” shall be subsrituted;. '
fb) for the words.“five hundred rupees™ appearing; in the fiest pmv:ao. &

. the words “seven thousand rupees™ shall be subsrifuted. !

Amendment of 7. For section 26-A. of the principal Act. the followmg section shall be
suction 26-A substinged.—- - ]
/f “"6 Al li a sHting member. dics dunng the tenure of hisor hergf
- / _ Family office. the spouse of such member shall be anled‘t
/ ‘ Pension 10 a family pemsion equal 1o 50% pension -ptherwise’ ;
L admlwble to the deceased member at lhe time af death, for the Ixfe—ume c»f?
“such spouse. ] : ‘ : %

_ (2) If an ex-member. who is entitled to a pensnon under«,
sub-section (1} of section 24, dies. the spouse of such ex-member shall be’
enutled to -a family pension equal 0 50% of pension of :.uchgj

cx-member at the time of death. for the life-ime of such spouse: j:

S

Provided that if the spouse is entitled to a salary under section 3 or a pcnsmn
undu- sub-section (1) of section 24 she/he will ‘not be entitled to receive famtly
pension under sub-section (1) or sub-section (2) ‘ :_’.

1176 ®#PH_Vidhan Mandal-Adhi-2010_Dua 2



j‘!
i

JAY FTY INNURY] TNTC, 05 4, 2010

CHAPTIER-I

the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers’ Safaries and

Amendment of
Allowances) Act, 1952

8. [n scction 2 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legiskature (Officers Salaries and
| Allowances) Act, 1952, Ilwre:'nnﬁer referred o in this chapter as the principal Aci. in
jgub-seclion (1) for the words “five thousand rupees” the words “twelve thousand
_rupees” shall be substituted.

9. In section 4 of the principal Act. in sub-secuion (3) for the words “ten
thousand rupees” the words “fifieen thousand rupces”™ shall be substituted.

CHAPTER-I1V
Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries. Alowances and
Miscellancous Provisions) Act, 1981

. 10. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers {Salaries. Allowances and
Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981 ~
(a) in sub-section (1) for the words “five thousand mpecs " the words

“twelve thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

{b) in sub-section (2) for the words “four thousand rupees” the words
“ten thousand rupces” shall be substituied.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Amendmeny of
seetion 2 of ULP.
Actno, | 1ol
1952

Amendment of
section 4

Amendment of
section 3 of ULP.
Actno. 14 of
1981

The pay. atlowances. pension and other amenities admissible to the members and ofTicers of the

State Legisiature and to the ministers have not been revised for a quite some time. In view

and escalation in cost of living it has been decided to revise the same so that they may sc

of the price rise

rve the cause of

their constituency in a meaningful manner by amending the Uttar Pradesh State Lepislamure (Members®

Emoluments and Pension) Act. 1980. the Utiar Pradesh Stawe lLegislature (Officers Salaries and

Allbwanccs) Act. 1952 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries. Allowances and Miscellaneous

Provisions) Act, 1981,

It has been experienced that the spouses of deceased members and ex-members of legislature have

been facing hardship and have been living in penury.'In difference to the dignity of ofﬁcé which they ha\re

held it has also been decided to prov:de for making, in the aforesaid Act of ]980 provision for fanulv o '

pensmn 1o the spouse of the deceased members and ex-members of Lhe Statc Legls!amre

o

The Utar Pradef.h State begsslaturc Membem and Officers and Ministers Amenitics la

(Amendment) Bill. 2010 |s.mlr0duced accordingly.

By order,
PV, KUSHWAHA.
Sachi

thowozgoﬁm g0 f0-1176 - (F"o) -2010-(2497)-597-(Fg0-< /ATHAR) |
Siowwogodo-10 $0-237 w0 faurdl-2010-(2498)-850(F¥0 a/maz.




